
Ms. Khushbu Jain is a practicing advocate before the Supreme Court of India, and founding 
partner ARK Legal.  She is executive board member of ACFCS India Chapter Board. She has 
also contributed to Maharashtra Cyber and Bombay Management Association in an advisory 
role.

She curated a talk series ‘Reboot’ - a unique initiative of Bombay Stock Exchange (BSE) in 
collaboration with Ark Legal, envisioned to address the burgeoning need to engage with the 
intersections of finance, technology and law. 


She is a recognised name in the field of cyber security and financial crimes involving 
technologies and provides comprehensive advice on technology-related legal matters, 
including data privacy compliance, cybersecurity preparedness and financial crimes. 


Ms. Jain has been training International bodies, State Government employees and 
Corporates with a view of institutional capacity building. She has led several initiatives for 
creating awareness on Cyber Crime and engendering a better understanding of Technology 
laws. She speaks and writes extensively on issues related to Technology Law, Privacy and 
Cyber and is a opinion column writer for newspapers and a popular guest on national and 
international television.


On the Corporate front, she is a consultant to members of SEBI, and advises them on issues 
ranging from Prohibition of Fraudulent and Unfair Trade Practices (PFUTP), Embezzlement, 
Prohibition of Insider Trading (PIT) and other relevant issues. She has successfully defended 
several clients facing cartel and bid-rigging trials and has advised them on numerous Abuse 
of Dominance matters.


She has represented high profile clients such as Government CPSEs, private listed and 
unlisted companies, individuals, and has also been appearing in the Supreme Court of India, 
High Court of Delhi & Bombay, PMLA Court, Competition Commission of India, NCLT, and 
Arbitration and have represented them in various enforcement agencies such as ED, EOW, 
SFIO and others. 
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